Town of Hanover
Annual FY-2022 -

Water Materials

i ] ) Ferguson Waterworks John Hoadley & Sons, inc Stiles Company, inc. Ti Sales
_\N_gt(-?r Dlsmlqn 2 Whitman Road 672 Union Street 922 Pleasant Street 36 Hudson Road
Materials & Supplies Canton, MA 02021 Rockland MA 02370 Norwood, MA 02062 Sudbury, MA 01776
Justin Vick Donna Hoadley Katie Kasowitz Martin Mazzella
item 3 781/ 828-1350 781/ 878-8098 800/ 426-6246 800/ 225-4616
|Gate Valves, Fittings- ltem 3-1
Valves - resilient seat
6", 10, more or less $533.31 $518.00 .
8,10, more or less $849.40 $825.00 No Bid No Bid
10", 05 more or less $1,324.36 $1,285.00
12", 05 more or less $1,675.80 $1,620.00
Mueller Super Centurian Hydrants-
250 Fire Hydrants - item 3-2
20 more or less $2,072.35 $1,995.00 No Bid No Bid
] 6" through 12" Ductile lron Pipe - item 3-3
6", CLDI PIPE 60 feet, more or less - (per LF) $20.70 $19.00
8", CLDIPIPE 60 feet, more or less - {per LF) $29.20 $26.80 l\l S l ; '! d P l o B " d
10", CLDIPIPE 40 feet, more or less - (per LF) $38.28 $35.10 J
12", CLDI PIPE 40 feet, more or less - {(per LF) $48.20 $44.25
Pricing for DI Pipe
COMMENT can only be held firm
for 180 Days
Valve Boxes & Curb Boxes - item 3-4
Vaive Box (Complete Set) - EstQty-30 $119.48 $144.00
Valve Box (Tops & Covers) - EstQty - 30 $68.80 $70.50 - ‘
Valve Box Covers - EstQty-20 $14.46 $15.00 Nﬂ Bl C K]Q ,B ! EJ
Curb Box (Complete Set) - Est Qty - 256 $72.89 $75.00
Curb Box (Tops & Covers) - EstQty-25 $34.03 $35.00
|Hymax Couplings - item 3-5
6", HYMAXCouplings - EstQty-10 $211.45 $209.00 $225.46 $233.40
8", HYMAXCouplings - EstQty-10 $238.73 $235.00 $254.54 $264.32
10", HYMAX Couplings - EstQty-10 $307.12 $303.00 $346.24 $336.33
12",  HYMAX Couplings - EstQty-10 $362.50 $358.00 $462.39 $410.98
16", HYMAXCouplings - EstQty-10 $1,012.14 $999.00 $1,079.18 $1,095.00
Polyethylene Tubing - item 3-6
3/4" Polyethylene Tubing - Est Qty - 200" . $0.30 . .
1" Polyethylene Tubing - _ Est Qty - 200' No Bi d $0.49 No Bi d No Bi d
2" Polyethylene Tubing - Est Qty -200° $1.66

Bid opening ~ Wednesday - June 2, 2021 @ 2:00PM

Witnesses

Victor J. Diniak, Director of Public Works

Kurt Kelley, Deputy Superintendent of Field Operation
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Iltems in red boxes are the awarded contracts
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Items in red boxes are the awarded contracts


