Town of Hanover
Annual FY-2022 Bids
Service_Contracts_6_-_ Rentals

P.A. Landers Inc. John Hoad'l:g and Sons, Nesco LLC
351 Winter Street 672 Unior; Street 3112 E State Road 124
Equipment Rental - Item 6 Hanover, MA 02339 Rockland. MA 02370 Bluffton, IN 46714
David R. Prosper Donna’Hoa diey Jenna Maller
0 -71
781/ 826-8818 781/ 878-8098 260/ 824-7150
s Hourly Rate Hourly Rate Hourly Rate Hourly Rate Hourly Rate Hourly Rate
Eq""—'pment WI operator w/ Operator | w/o Operator | w/ Operator | w/o Operator | w/ Operator wio Operator
e —— ——
CAT 315 Excavator or equal 205.00 145.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
CAT 330 Excavator 240.00 180.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
CAT 330 Excavator w/ Hammer or equal 390.00 330.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
CAT 308 Mini Excavator or Equal 190.00 130.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bia
CAT 140H Grader or equal 215.00 155.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
CAT 950 Loader or equal 200.00 140.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
CAT 972-980 Loader or equal 245.00 185.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Cat D8 Bulldozer 280.00 220.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
w/ Bucket . .
Wheeled Skid Ster (50-75) HP) 190.00 130.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
w/ Bucket
Skid Steer w/ 15" minimum Cold Planer . . . .
attachment 295.00 235.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Skid St /soil Conditioner/P k
Att'ach,:::,:v * Moner/Power Rake 250.00 190.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
CAT 322 Rubber Tire Excavator or equal 235.00 175.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
w/ Digging & Cleanup Bucket ) )
CAT 322 Rubber Tire Excavator or equal 360.00 300.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
w/ Hammer attachment ) )
5100 Gradall Rubber Tire or equal 240.00 180.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
5200 Gradall Track or equal 240.00 180.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
- - " . $750.00 per 28 day
Dump Trailer 28 yd body 140.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $800.00 per move
. . . - $5,850.00 Per 28 day
10 Wheel Dump 20 yd body 130.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $800.00 per move
. . - . - $3,168.00 per 28 day
Bucket Truck 30’ - 45' Working Height No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $800.00 per move
Vactor 2100 Truck (or equal) w/Jet Rodding . . . . $14,000.00 per 28 day
Capability No Bid No Bid 225.00 No Bid No Bid $1.500.00 per move
{COMMENTS

Bid opening ~ Wednesday - June 2, 2021 @ 2:00PM

Witnesses

Victor J. Diniak, Director of Public Works

a2 T

Kurt Kelley, Deputy Superintendent of Field OperatiKn/s
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Iltems in red boxes are the awarded contracts
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