
BID 2025-016: Miscellaneous Construction Services Bid Opened: 04/11/24 @ 13:00

 Unit Price  Extended Price  Unit Price  Extended Price  Unit Price  Extended Price 

Large Excavator - Tracked 45,000lb - 60,000lb 40 Hr  $                 235.00  $              9,400.00  $                 225.00  $              9,000.00  No Bid  No Bid 

Medium Excavator - Tracked 35,000lb - 45,000lb 60 Hr  $                 200.00  $            12,000.00  $                 200.00  $            12,000.00  No Bid  No Bid 

Mini Excavator 12,000 lb 80 Hr  $                 175.00  $            14,000.00  $                 190.00  $            15,200.00  No Bid  No Bid 

Medium Pay Loader 25,000 lb 20 Hr  $                 195.00  $              3,900.00  $                 190.00  $              3,800.00  $                 185.00  $              3,700.00 

Tracked Skid Steer w/ Bucket Takeuchi TL150 or equal 40 Hr  $                 175.00  $              7,000.00  $                 180.00  $              7,200.00  $                 135.00  $              5,400.00 

Wheeled Excavator Gradall 3100 or equal 60 Hr  $                 230.00  $            13,800.00  $                 225.00  $            13,500.00  No Bid  No Bid 

80 Hr  $                 165.00  $            13,200.00  $                 140.00  $            11,200.00  No Bid  No Bid 

40 Hr  $                 160.00  $              6,400.00  $                 130.00  $              5,200.00  No Bid  No Bid 

40 Hr  $                 155.00  $              6,200.00  $                 120.00  $              4,800.00  $                 125.00  $              5,000.00 

Road Grader 35,000 lb - 40,000 lb 60 Hr  $                 210.00  $            12,600.00  $                 225.00  $            13,500.00  No Bid  No Bid 

Mini Road Grader 12,000 lb 60 Hr  $                 180.00  $            10,800.00  $                 180.00  $            10,800.00  No Bid  No Bid 

Vibratory Soil Compactor/Roller Cat SC-563C or similar 60 Hr  $                 180.00  $            10,800.00  $                 175.00  $            10,500.00  No Bid  No Bid 

Sidewalk Paver Up to 5' Width with Operator 20 Hr  $                 220.00  $              4,400.00  $                 210.00  $              4,200.00  No Bid  No Bid 

Small Asphalt Roller 1.5 Ton Minimum 20 Hr  $                 180.00  $              3,600.00  $                 175.00  $              3,500.00  No Bid  No Bid 

Medium Asphalt Paver Leeboy 700 or Equal 80 Hr  $                 250.00  $            20,000.00  $                 275.00  $            22,000.00  No Bid  No Bid 

Medium Asphalt Roller 5-7 Ton Minimum 40 Hr  $                 185.00  $              7,400.00  $                 175.00  $              7,000.00  No Bid  No Bid 

Small Bulldozer Cat D3 or Equal 40 Hr  $                 185.00  $              7,400.00  $                 175.00  $              7,000.00  No Bid  No Bid 

Medium Bulldozer Cat D5 or Equal 40 Hr  $                 200.00  $              8,000.00  $                 185.00  $              7,400.00  No Bid  No Bid 

Road Reclaimer 60,000 lb 60 Hr  $                 675.00  $            40,500.00  $                 650.00  $            39,000.00  No Bid  No Bid 

Utility Service Truck w/ Tools
To include generator, pumps, lights, safety equipment, 

etc.
100 Hr  $                 110.00  $            11,000.00  $                   25.00  $              2,500.00  No Bid  No Bid 

Walk Behind Road Saw CoreCut CC1800 or Equal 20 Hr  $                 240.00  $              4,800.00  $                 100.00  $              2,000.00  No Bid  No Bid 

100 CY  $                   15.00  $              1,500.00  $                   10.00  $              1,000.00  No Bid  No Bid 

Miscellaneous Administrative Work
Plan/Work Preparation to Include: Scheduling, Staffing & 

Equipment, Health & Safety, Traffic Management
1 LS  $                 800.00  $                 800.00  $                      0.01  $                      0.01  No Bid  No Bid 

Note: 1. Bid submitted by Northeast Weathered Services considered incomplete and non-compliant due to missing unit prices.

Witnessed By:
Victor Diniak, Director of Public Works:

Kurt Kelley, Deputy Superintendent of Public Works:

6 -Wheel Dump Truck

Legal Disposal of Non-Contaminated Soil

Total Bid (Figures):  $                                             229,500.00 

 Hanover, MA 02339 

Tri-Axle Dump Truck

10-Wheel Dump Truck

 $                                             212,300.01 

 41 Pleasant Street - Suite 10 
 Norton, MA 02766 

 $                                               14,100.00 

 Mass Pavement Reclamation, Inc.  Northeast Weathered Services 
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Town of Hanover
Department of Public Works

Bid Tabulation

 147 Clay Pit Road 
 Marshfield, MA 02050 

 P.A. Landers, Inc 
 PO Box 217 


