
BID 2025-015: Construction Equipment Rental Bid Opened: 04/11/24 @ 13:00

With Operator Without Operator With Operator Without Operator With Operator Without Operator

Cat 416 or 426 Backhoe or equal  $                      225.00  $                      165.00  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

 Cat 315 Excavator or equal  $                      235.00  $                      175.00  No Bid  $                         88.00  No Bid  No Bid 

Cat 330 Excavator  $                      275.00  $                      215.00  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

Cat 330 Excavator with hammer or equal  $                      420.00  $                      360.00  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

Cat 308 Mini Excavator or equal  $                      215.00  $                      155.00  No Bid  $                         66.00  No Bid  No Bid 

Cat 140H Grader or equal  $                      255.00  $                      195.00  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

Cat 950 Loader or equal  $                      250.00  $                      190.00  No Bid  $                         69.00  No Bid  No Bid 

Cat 972-980 Loader or equal  $                      285.00  $                      225.00  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

Cat D8 Bulldozer  $                      305.00  $                      245.00  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

Tracked Skid Steer (50-75 HP) with bucket  $                      220.00  $                      160.00  No Bid  $                         47.00  No Bid  No Bid 

Wheeled Skid Steer (50-75 HP) with bucket  $                      220.00  $                      160.00  No Bid  $                         32.00  No Bid  No Bid 

Skid Steer with 15” minimum cold planer attachment  $                      310.00  $                      250.00  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

Skid Steer with Soil Conditioner/Power Rake Attachment  $                      265.00  $                      205.00  No Bid  $                         60.00  No Bid  No Bid 

Cat 322 Rubber Tire Excavator (or equal) with digging & cleanup bucket  $                      270.00  $                      210.00  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

Cat 322 Rubber Tire Excavator (or equal) with hammer attachment  $                      365.00  $                      305.00  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

5100 Gradall Rubber Tire or equal  $                      275.00  $                      215.00  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

5200 Gradall Tracked or equal  $                      275.00  $                      215.00  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

Dump Trailer w/ minimum 28-yard body  $                      165.00  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

10-wheel dump truck w/ 20-yd body  $                      160.00  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

Bucket Truck 30’-45’ Working Height  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

Vactor 2100 Truck (or equal) with Jet Rodding Capability  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  $                      225.00  No Bid 

Primary Contract Award
Secondary Contract Award

Witnessed By:
Victor Diniak, Director of Public Works:

Kurt Kelley, Deputy Superintendent of Public Works:

 John Hoadley and Sons, Inc. 

 672 Union Street 

 Rockland, MA 02370 

Town of Hanover

Department of Public Works

Bid Tabulation

Item

 P.A. Landers, Inc.  Quality Fleet, LLC 

 PO Box 217 

 Hanover, MA 02339 

 2000 Main Street 

 Brockton, MA 02301 


