BID 2025-006: Water Distribution Materials

TOWN OF HANOVER

DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC WORKS

BID TABULATION

Bid Opened: 04/11/24 @ 13:00

Stiles Company, Inc. John Hoadley & Sons, Inc. Fergusson Waterworks Core and Main

922 Pleasant Street 672 Union Street 2 Whitman Road 655 Pleasant Street

Norwood, MA 02062 Rockland, MA 02370 Canton, MA 02021 Norwood, MA 02062

Item No. Item
Price Price Price Price

3.1.A 6" Gate Valve No Bid $ 888.00 | $ 711.02 | $ 892.88
3.1.B 8" Gate Valve No Bid $ 1,414.00 | $ 906.90 | $ 1,422.07
3.1.C 10" Gate Valve No Bid $ 2,200.00 | $ 2,252.10 | $ 2,217.28
3.1.D 12" Gate Valve No Bid $ 2,784.00 | $ 2,849.73 | $ 2,805.66
3.2A Mueller Hydrant No Bid $ 3,149.00 | $ 3,196.11| $ 3,229.41
3.3A 6" CLDI Pipe No Bid $ 29.90 | $ 2851 $ 28.96
3.3.B 8" CLDI Pipe No Bid $ 4220 ( $ 40.23 | $ 40.87
3.3.C 10" CLDI Pipe No Bid $ 55.22 | $ 5273 | $ 53.48
3.3.D 12" CLDI Pipe No Bid $ 69.64 | $ 66.39 | $ 67.45
3.4.A Valve Box (Complete Set) No Bid $ 237.00| $ 167.59 | $ 209.00
3.4.B Valve Box (Tops & Covers) No Bid $ 156.50 | $ 100.71 | $ 101.00
3.4.C Valve Box Covers No Bid $ 19.75 | $ 2385 $ 20.00
3.4.D Curb Box (Complete Set) No Bid $ 127.00 [ $ 85.54 | $ 139.00
3.4.E Curb Box (Tops & Covers) No Bid $ 7350 | $ 4389 | $ 71.00
3.5.A 6" Hymax Coupling $ 332211 $ 285.00 | $ 30091 | $ 315.00
3.5.B 8" Hymax Coupling $ 375.06 | $ 32225 $ 339.74 | $ 355.00
3.5.C 10" Hymax Coupling $ 48251 | $ 414.50 | $ 437.05 | $ 483.00
3.5.D 12" Hymax Coupling $ 569.51 | $ 489.00 | $ 515.86 | $ 646.00
3.5.E 16" Hymax Coupling $ 1,559.87 [ $ 1,340.00 | $ 1,412.92 | $ 1,479.00
3.6.A 3/4" Polyethlene Tubing No Bid $ 040 $ 033 $ 0.042
3.6.B 1" Polyethlene Tubing No Bid $ 065 $ 0.49 | $ 0.94
3.6.C 2" Polyethlene Tubing No Bid $ 220 $ 213 | $ 2.29
Note: 1. Unit pricing submitted for 3/4" Polyethlene Tubing by Core and Main was confirmed on 04/12/24 to be submitted in error.

Witnessed By:

Victor Diniak, Director of Public Works:

Kurt Kelley, Deputy Superintendent of Public Works:




