
BID 2025-005: Bulk Highway Materials Bid Opened: 04/11/24 @ 13:00

G. Lopes Construction, Inc T.L. Edwards, Inc. P.A. Landers, Inc

490 Winthrop Street PO Box 507 PO Box 217

Taunton, MA 02780 Avon, MA 02322 Hanover, MA 02339

Bid Price Bid Price Bid Price

A Stone Dust/Stone Screenings 35.50$                                                                          23.00$                                                                          20.00$                                                                          

B Pea Stone/Crushed Stone 31.45$                                                                          No Bid 26.50$                                                                          

C Sand Borrow 22.50$                                                                          No Bid 19.00$                                                                          
D Loam Borrow 25.50$                                                                          20.00$                                                                          14.00$                                                                          
E Reclaimed Asphalt Borrow 21.95$                                                                          No Bid 12.50$                                                                          
F Processed Gravel 29.95$                                                                          No Bid 14.00$                                                                          
G Hot Mix Asphalt (Picked Up) No Bid 79.00$                                                                          No Bid

Witnessed By:
Victor Diniak, Director of Public Works:

Kurt Kelley, Deputy Superintendent of Public Works:
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