BID 2025-004: Water Treatment Chemicals

TOWN OF HANOVER

DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC WORKS

BID TABULATION

Bid Opened: 04/11/24 @ 13:00

Holland Company, Inc. Chemtrade Harcros Chemicals, Inc. Brentag Northeast, LLC Borden & Remington Corp. Coyne Chemical Chemrite, Inc. Shannon Chemical Corporation
Item No. Item 153 Howland Avenue 90 East Halsey Road 8 Capitol Street 81W. Huller Lane 63 Water Street 3015 State Road 5202 Belle Wood Court - Suite 104 PO Box 376
Adams, MA 01220 Parsippany, NJ 07054 Nashua, NH 03063 Reading, PA 19605 Fall River, MA 02722 Croydon, PA 19021 Buford, GA 30518 Malvern, PA 19355
3A.1 Price per gallon delivered $1.70500 $2.02500
3A.2 Option 1 Fuel Factor 0.01400 0.00000
3A.3 Split Delivery Fee $100.00000 $75.00000
E " "
3A4 El Price per gallon delivered $2.77000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
< Option 2
3A.5 Fuel Factor 0.04800 0.00000
3A6 Location of Manufacture Adams, ON
3A7 Emg. Delivery Surcharge $0.00000 $200.00000
3B.1 £ Price per gallon delivered $8.98000
3B.2 g ° Split Delivery Fee $0.00000
g
3B.3 § % Fuel Factor No Bid No Bid 0.00000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
17}
3B.4 2 Location of Manufacture Searsport, ME
=3
3B.5 - Emg. Delivery Surcharge $500.00000
3C.1 Price per Pound Delivered $3.98000 $5.62000
3c.2 g | Domestic Fuel Factor 0.00000 0.00000
c Made No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3C.3 n:a Material Manufacturer Carus Corporation Carus Corporation
5
3C.4 E Location of Manufacture La Salle, IL La Salle, IL
& No Bid No Bid
3C.5 £ Price per Pound Delivered $3.16380 $2.58620 $2.22000 $2.78000
3 .
3C6 2 Foreign Fuel Factor 0.00000 0.00000 0.00000 0.00000
2 Made No Bid No Bid
3C.7 a ; Manufacturer N/A Organic Industries K-Ox/Universal Universal
Material
3C.8 Location of Manufacture India India India India
3D.1 Price per gallon delivered $7.69000 $5.92310
3D.2 ° Option 1 Fuel Factor 0.00000 0.00000
]
3D.3 K Split Delivery Fee $800.00000 $0.00000
3D.4 %‘ Price per gallon delivered $9.15000 $7.07120
£ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3D.5 2 Option 2 Fuel Factor 0.00000 0.00000
a
3D.6 g Split Delivery Fee $800.00000 $0.00000
<
3D.6 Location of Manufacture Ashtabula, OH Fall River, MA
3D.7 Emg. Delivery Surcharge $800.00000 $450.00000
3E.1 © Price per gallon delivered $2.68000 $5.45000
k2 |[ES 5 Split Delivery Fee $0.00000 $0.00000
56 3 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3E3 | 3 § @ Fuel Factor 0.00000 0.00000
T
3E4 Name of Manufacturer Harcros Chemicals, Inc. Olin/Borden & Remington
3F.1 g Price per ton delivered $605.50000
3F.2 2 Fuel Factor 0.00000
o1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3F.3 g Name of Manufacturer Graymont
=3
3F.4 T Location of Manufacture Pennsylvania
Witnessed By:

Victor Diniak, Director of Public Works:

Kurt Kelley, Deputy Superintendent of Public Works:




